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Manager's Introduction

As we turn the page to a new year, we reflect on the cherished moments and joyous
experiences we've shared together in 2024. We look forward to embracing the new
year, celebrating milestones and continuing to provide a caring and nurturing
environment for our wonderful residents. Let's make 2025 a year filled with
happiness, achievements and special moments!

Also, if you know someone who would like to receive our email newsletters/updates
just let us know, or forward them the newsletter sign up link below:

Newsletter Sign-Up 

Best wishes, 

Preet Hundal
Home Manager

Black & Gold Dinner Party

This January, our residents at The Ashton kicked off the new year in style with a
delightful Black & Gold dinner party! The evening was filled with anticipation, joy, and
a vibrant atmosphere as everyone came together to celebrate the beginning of 2025.
The dining room was beautifully decorated in elegant black and gold hues, creating
a festive ambiance that set the perfect tone for the night. Our talented kitchen staff
prepared a sumptuous feast, featuring a variety of dishes that catered to all tastes.
Here at The Ashton, we believe in celebrating life's special moments, and this dinner
party was just the beginning of a fantastic year ahead! 

Hinckley Christmas Lights Tour

It was delightful to witness our beautiful Christmas lights as we listened to carols,
followed by delicious hot chocolate and a mince pie. We then took a short ride to
nearby areas to discover more lights and found several to enjoy. We also met Santa
and received a present.

Enderby Brass Band

There’s nothing quite like a Brass Band to create a Christmas atmosphere. The
mulled wine was flowing, mince pies and Christmas cake plentiful. Everyone had a
delightful time with family and friends. A huge thank you to The Enderby Brass Band
for coming and entertaining us with their beautiful music, it brought tears to many
eyes. We can’t wait to see them again next year.

Make-A-Wish Christmas Market

Many thanks to everyone who attended our very first Christmas Market raising
money for our chosen charity Make-A-Wish UK. It was a fabulous afternoon, starting
off the festive season. Thank you to all the stall holders and the Church choir, who
closed the event with festive melodies. Congratulations to Gill who won the large
hamper. We raised an incredible £345.70 for the charity.

Hinckley School Shrek Panto

We would like to express our gratitude to the Hinckley School for entertaining us
today with their Shrek Panto and music band. We all had a fantastic day and are
eager to see them again.

Private Lights Tour

Maureen and her family had a wonderful evening exploring the Christmas lights in
the nearby village during their private tour. They admired the beautiful decorations
on the homes and churches, all aglow with festive illumination. The minibus was
filled with the sounds of cheerful Christmas music, which we all sang along to. Upon
their return to The Ashton, they were welcomed with mulled wine and mince pies,
served in a private setting exclusively for their enjoyment.

Upcoming Dates For The Diary

January

10th - Music from The Heart
17th - Interactive Music Therapy 
22nd - Mike Underhill

And plenty more of our regular activities.

Keeping In Touch

We look forward to sharing posts on our Facebook Page and will be keeping it
updated with news and photos.

Make sure to check out The Ashton Care Home Facebook Page and give us a Like! 
 

Our Facebook Page
 

Leave A Review

All feedback is very much appreciated and we would be very grateful if you could
spare a few minutes to write a review for us:
 

Carehome.co.uk Review

Google My Business Review
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