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Welcome To Our Newsletter

Happy New Year to all our residents, relatives and friends! We appreciate all your
support and we look forward to a wonderful year ahead. We welcome the year 2024
with our continued commitment to providing exceptional care and support to our
residents. 

We would like to give a special mention to our dedicated staff who have worked
tirelessly over the festive period. A big thank you to all our team for making this
Christmas and New Year so magical and enjoyable for all in our care.

Also, if you know someone who would like to receive our email newsletters/updates
just let us know, or forward them the newsletter sign up link below:

Newsletter Sign-Up 

Best wishes, 

Preet Hundal
Home Manager

Activity Calendar

We have lots planned in January, click the link below to view our Activity Planner...
 

Click here to download, print or view...

We would be delighted to welcome any family members/friends that would like to
come in and enjoy the entertainment with their loved ones.

Christmas Celebrations

Here at The Ashton, December was all about Christmas celebrations which started
on Wednesday 7th.

Every year we are invited by the local council to go on the Christmas Light Tour. This
is a route through the main street of Hinckley to see the Christmas lights with carol
singers and street artists on route. We then stop outside the church for coffee/tea
and a mince pie and not forgetting a visit from Santa.

This year, we went on our own minibus with Martin driving. After our refreshments,
Martin took us round to see the Christmas lights of Burbage.

On the 9th of December, we celebrated with our loved ones at our annual Christmas
party with lots of festive nibbles and entertainment from Enderby Brass Band.

On Christmas Day itself, some of our residents had their loved ones come along for
Christmas dinner.

Local Community Links

Through our local community links, we have been lucky to have visits from Smiles
Nursery, The Little Explorers from St Peter’s Church, Hinckley School (High School),
Hinckley Parks Primary School and North Warwickshire and South Leicestershire
College. All these visits bought lots of smiles to the faces of our residents.

Smiles Nursery

Hinckley School

Hinckley School were with us on Tuesday 19th from 10.30am to 12.00pm. YR10
drama group performed their pantomime, Aladdin, and then the music teacher, Mr
Riley, introduced some of his music students who played the keyboard and sang
Christmas songs for us which we all sang along to. After their performances, the
students handed out Christmas cards and gifts to the residents.

 

The Little Explorers

The Little Explorers sang some of their Christmas songs to us that they had been
learning and then did some colouring with the residents.

 

North Warwickshire & South Leicestershire College

On Tuesday 19th, we had a treat for our ladies, a pamper session with the students
from NWSLC. The ladies could have a hand/arm massage as well as a lovely
manicure and painted nails if they wished.

Live Entertainment

We have been entertained by Mike and Di. Always popular visitors to the home
bringing along with them song sheets for the residents so they can sing along if they
wish.

The performance was interrupted when 'The Grinch' made an appearance! You're a
mean one, Mr. Grinch!

Birthday Celebrations

In December, we celebrated birthdays with Katie and Jean T, along with Kathleen B
whose birthday was on Christmas Day!

Keeping In Touch

We look forward to sharing posts on our Facebook Page and will be keeping it
updated with news and photos.

Make sure to check out The Ashton Care Home Facebook Page and give us a Like! 
 

Our Facebook Page
 

Leave A Review

All feedback is very much appreciated and we would be very grateful if you could
spare a few minutes to write a review for us:
 

Carehome.co.uk Review

Google My Business Review
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